ORDINANCE 2025-40

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND TITLE 12, CHAPTER 10 OF THE FRANKLIN
MUNICIPAL CODE TO ADOPT THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE
FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS, 2024 EDITION.

WHEREAS, the Board of Mayor and Aldermen (“BOMA”) for the purpose of promoting
the public health, safety, comfort, convenience, and general welfare of the people of Franklin,
is authorized to prescribe regulations and standards for the design, construction, and repair to
buildings and structures within the City; and

WHEREAS, Tennessee Code Annotated Title 6, Chapter 54, Part 5 allows municipalities
to adopt building codes by reference; and

WHEREAS, Tennessee Code Annotated Title 68, Chapter 120, requires that for cities that
enforce their own building construction safety standards, the building codes adopted by
reference must be current within seven years of the date of the latest editions; and

WHEREAS, in its legislative judgment the BOMA has found that building regulations and
standards must be dynamic and modified from time to time to reflect changes in model codes,
construction materials, recognized construction methods, and safety standards necessary to
preserve and promote the private and public interest; and

WHEREAS, many surrounding communities have adopted or will adopt the 2024
International Code Council series of codes which allows builders, designers, and developers to
reference one version of code books in the Middle Tennessee area; and

WHEREAS, the BOMA finds this action to be in the best interest of the City.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF FRANKLIN BOARD OF MAYOR
AND ALDERMEN, AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION I. That Title 12, Chapter 10, Section 12-1001 of the City of Franklin Municipal Code
is hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following:

12-1001. — Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings adopted.

(1) Pursuant to authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated, §§ 6-54-501, et
seq., and for the purpose of regulating the fabrication, erection, construction,
enlargement, alteration, repair, location and use of detached one- and two-
family dwellings, their appurtenances and accessory structures, so as to
safeguard life, health, and public welfare, the International Residential Code for
One- and Two-Family Dwellings, 2024 edition, with Appendix CD and BO, as
prepared by the International Code Council, is hereby adopted and incorporated
by reference as a part of this Code, and is hereinafter referred to as the Residential
Code.

1 Law Dept approved 08.28.25




(2)

Pursuant to authority granted by Tennessee Code Annotated, § 6-54-502(c), the
Building and Neighborhood Services Director shall adopt administrative
regulations to incorporate subsequent amendments to the International
Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings, 2024 edition, as published
by the International Code Council. These amendments shall be identified by the
building and neighborhood services director as to date and source and shall take
effect as provided in Tennessee Code Annotated, § 6-54-502, unless disapproved
by the Board of Mayor and Aldermen.

SECTION Il. That Title 12, Chapter 10, Section 12-1002 of the City of Franklin Municipal
Code is hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following:

Sec. 12-1002. - Amendments to the 2024 edition of the International Residential Code.

(1)

(2)

(3)

Section R105.2(1) and (5), Work exempt from permit, are amended to read as follows
and included in the list of types of work that are exempt from the requirement to
obtain a building permit:

Section R105.2 (1) Building:

One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses
and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 200 square feet. Permits
for accessory structures, shall be required in accordance with the City of Franklin
Zoning Ordinance.

Section R105.2 (5) Building:

Sidewalks and driveways located entirely on private property. Permits for sidewalks
and driveways shall be required in accordance with the City of Franklin Zoning
Ordinance.

Section 112 Board of Appeals is deleted and in its place is approved to read as
follows:

Section 112 Means of Appeal. Appeals of decisions of the Building Official (or his
designee) made under the International Residential Code shall be heard by the
Building and Streets Standards Board of Appeals established in Title 12, Chapter 12 of
the Municipal Code.

Section R309, Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems of the International Residential Code,
2024 Edition, is deleted in lieu of the automatic fire sprinkler system requirements
found in Title 7, Section 232 of the City of Franklin Municipal Code.

Except as provided all foundation walls are to be installed on concrete footings.

The Building Official may authorize the use of pre-engineered concrete foundation

systems as recognized in Section R402.3 of the International Residential Code to be

installed without a continuous concrete footing conditioned upon:

i. The permit applicant submitting a foundation plan and load calculations,
signed and sealed by a currently licensed State of Tennessee Structural
Engineer in conjunction with the building permit application, and

2 Law Dept approved 08.28.25




(5)

(6)

(7)

(8)

(9)

(10)

ii. A soils report prepared by a certified State of Tennessee geotechnical
engineer, shall be provided to the inspector, on-site, prior to the placement
of the required stone base, and

iii. At the discretion of the Building Official, an as-built survey to verify the
location and height of the foundation walls prior to above ground
construction commencing, and

iv. Compliance with all other applicable City of Franklin adopted building codes,
amendments, and ordinances.

The text of Table 403.1 is deleted and replaced with the following:

Footings, which support a single story structure, shall have minimum dimensions of
eight (8) inches thickness and 16 inches width. Footings, which support 2-story
structures, shall have minimum dimensions of 10 inches thickness and 20 inches
width. Footings, which support more than two stories, shall have minimum
dimensions of 12 inches thickness and 24 inches width. Footings are to be continuous
with a minimum of two (2) courses of %-inch or greater reinforcing steel installed.
Some site conditions may necessitate footings to be engineered.

The first sentence of Section R406.1 is amended to delete the words "and enclose
habitable or usable spaces below grade” so that the sentence reads: Except where
required to be waterproofed by Section R406.2, foundation walls that retain earth
shall be damp-proofed from the top of the footing to the finished grade.

The first sentence of Section R406.2 is amended to delete the words "and enclose
habitable or usable spaces located below grade" so that the sentence reads: In areas
where a high water table or other severe soil-water conditions are known to exist,
exterior foundation walls that retain earth shall be waterproofed with a membrane
extending from the top of the footing to the finished grade.

Section R406.3 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: Wood
foundations located below grade are not permitted within the City of Franklin.

The text of Section R407 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: No
foundation columns made of wood shall be used in crawl spaces where use of
concrete masonry blocks or similar material can be used in compliance with the
applicable code. In situations where such concrete masonry blocks or similar material
cannot accomplish this according to code, columns must be designed by an engineer
before installation. When a designed alternative column is used, protection from
possible moisture or other conditions causing deterioration will be necessary. Steel
pipe, of adequate size and loading capacity, may be used as interior crawl space
columns when pier footings are elevated at least two inches above final grade of crawl
space area. Such pipes shall be anchored top and bottom and shall be painted with a
rust-resistant paint.

At least one positive drain is required in every crawl-space foundation upon which a
structure is to be constructed. Positive drains shall be installed in such a manner to
drain all water that may accumulate. Crawl space grading shall be accomplished prior
to any construction beginning on the foundation. Such grading shall be consistent in
grade that will drain any possible water from all areas of the crawl space. No pockets

3 Law Dept approved 08.28.25




or trenches will be allowed to collect water. Natural soils shall be required to achieve
proper grade to the positive drain.

(11)  Chapter 11 of the International Residential Code is deleted in its entirety. The energy
code for one- and two-family dwellings shall be the currently adopted International
Energy Conservation Code.

(12)  Section R408.3 Unvented Crawl Space is amended to read as follows:
Ventilation openings in under-floor spaces specified in Sections R408.1 and R408.2
shall not be required where exposed earth is covered with a continuous Class | vapor
retarder. Joints of the vapor retarder shall overlap by 6 inches (152 mm) and shall be
sealed or taped. The edges of the vapor retarder shall extend at least 6 inches (152
mm) up the stem wall and shall be attached and sealed to the stem wall or insulation.

SECTION IIl. That Title 12, Chapter 1, Section 12-1003 of the City of Franklin Municipal Code
is hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following:

12-1003. Available in recorder's office.

Pursuant to the requirements of Tennessee Code Annotated, § 6-54-502, one (1) copy of
the Residential Code with the above modifications has been placed on file in the
recorder's office and shall be kept there for the use and inspection of the public.
Administrative regulations adopting amendments to the International Residential Code
for One- and Two-Family Dwellings, 2024 edition will be placed on file when they are
published by the Building and Neighborhood Services Director, and at least fifteen (15)
days before their effective date.

SECTION V. Severability. In the event that any section, clause, provision, or part of this
ordinance shall be found and determined to be invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction,
all valid parts that are severable full force and effect. If any part of this ordinance is found
to be invalid in any one or more of its several applications, all valid applications that are
severable from the invalid applications shall remain in effect.

SECTION V. Repeal and Savings Clause. All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict
herewith are hereby repealed; provided, however, that nothing herein contained shall affect
any rights, actions or causes of action which shall have accrued to the City of Franklin prior
to the effective date of this ordinance.

SECTION VI: BE IT FINALLY ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF MAYOR AND ALDERMEN OF THE CITY
OF FRANKLIN, TENNESSEE, that this ordinance shall be in full force and in effect for any permit
application received by the Building and Neighborhood Services Department on or after
January 1, 2026, for the health, safety, and welfare of the citizens of Franklin, Tennessee,
requiring it.

4 Law Dept approved 08.28.25




ATTEST:

By:
Angie Skarp
City Recorder

Approved as to form by:

Nl St

William E. Squires
Deputy City Attorney

PASSED FIRST READING

PASSED SECOND READING:

CITY Of FRANKLIN, TENNESSEE:

By:

Dr. Ke
Mayor

Moo

1/22/25 ,3-0
/4 /15 3-0

Law Dept approved 08.28.25






